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From the pages of Geoff Johns’s best-selling storyline in JUSTICE LEAGUE, it’s the Justice League like
you’ve never seen them before—with the power of gods!

The greatest evil in the universe has been wiped out. Darkseid, lord of Apokolips, is dead. But the death of a
god carries great consequences. Now the Justice League, Earth’s greatest heroes, find themselves with more
power than they’ve ever imagined.

But all power has a price—and for the heroes of the Justice League, the price may just be their humanity.
Now, Batman is driven non-stop by his power as the God of Knowledge. Superman, the God of Strength,
begins to view humans as inferior. The Flash tries to outrun his fate as the God of Death. Green Lantern
struggles with his newfound power as the God of Light. Shazam embraces a new pantheon as the God of
Gods. And Lex Luthor…

…where Darkseid fell, Lex Luthor may rise to take his place!

If Earth’s greatest heroes can’t find their way back to their humanity, they may bring about their own
destruction.

Written by an all-star team including Geoff Johns, Tom King, Peter J. Tomasi, Rob Williams, Francis
Manapul and Steve Orlando, this graphic novel is an integral companion piece to JUSTICE LEAGUE VOL.
7: DARKSEID WAR. Collects JUSTICE LEAGUE: GODS AND MEN SUPERMAN #1, JUSTICE
LEAGUE: GODS AND MEN BATMAN #1, JUSTICE LEAGUE: GODS AND MEN THE FLASH #1,
JUSTICE LEAGUE: GODS AND MEN GREEN LANTERN #1, JUSTICE LEAGUE: GODS AND MEN
SHAZAM! #1 and JUSTICE LEAGUE: GODS AND MEN LEX LUTHOR #1.
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From reader reviews:

Henry Robinson:

Nowadays reading books become more than want or need but also turn into a life style. This reading routine
give you lot of advantages. Associate programs you got of course the knowledge your information inside the
book which improve your knowledge and information. The info you get based on what kind of guide you
read, if you want drive more knowledge just go with education books but if you want experience happy read
one together with theme for entertaining including comic or novel. The particular Justice League: Darkseid
War - Power of the Gods (Jla (Justice League of America)) is kind of book which is giving the reader
unpredictable experience.

Courtney O\'Donnell:

Hey guys, do you desires to finds a new book to learn? May be the book with the concept Justice League:
Darkseid War - Power of the Gods (Jla (Justice League of America)) suitable to you? The actual book was
written by popular writer in this era. Often the book untitled Justice League: Darkseid War - Power of the
Gods (Jla (Justice League of America))is the main one of several books that will everyone read now. This
particular book was inspired many men and women in the world. When you read this guide you will enter
the new age that you ever know ahead of. The author explained their plan in the simple way, and so all of
people can easily to understand the core of this book. This book will give you a lots of information about this
world now. So that you can see the represented of the world in this book.

Tracy Caudle:

Justice League: Darkseid War - Power of the Gods (Jla (Justice League of America)) can be one of your
beginner books that are good idea. We recommend that straight away because this book has good vocabulary
that can increase your knowledge in vocabulary, easy to understand, bit entertaining but nonetheless
delivering the information. The article writer giving his/her effort to get every word into enjoyment
arrangement in writing Justice League: Darkseid War - Power of the Gods (Jla (Justice League of America))
but doesn't forget the main point, giving the reader the hottest as well as based confirm resource details that
maybe you can be one among it. This great information can easily drawn you into fresh stage of crucial
contemplating.

Allen Barnett:

Your reading 6th sense will not betray you, why because this Justice League: Darkseid War - Power of the
Gods (Jla (Justice League of America)) guide written by well-known writer who really knows well how to
make book that may be understand by anyone who else read the book. Written with good manner for you,
dripping every ideas and creating skill only for eliminate your personal hunger then you still doubt Justice
League: Darkseid War - Power of the Gods (Jla (Justice League of America)) as good book not just by the
cover but also from the content. This is one book that can break don't evaluate book by its protect, so do you



still needing yet another sixth sense to pick that!? Oh come on your reading through sixth sense already told
you so why you have to listening to yet another sixth sense.
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