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A co-branded book project with Jisc (formerly the Joint Information Systems Commitee), off the back of
DigiFest 2014, a digital festival run by Jisc for the first time in 2014. The aim of the book is to bring cutting-
edge discussion as heard at DigiFest to the information professional/academic librarian readership. Digital
Futures will provide expert briefings to information professionals on the emerging trends in the digital
technologies that are transforming teaching and research in higher education.

Written by subject experts working at the forefront in emerging trends and digital technologies●

Encompasses issues that impact across the higher education institution: learning, research and network●

security
Aids strategic thinking and informs decision making●
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From reader reviews:

Michael Carr:

The book Digital Futures: Expert Briefings on Digital Technologies for Education and Research can give
more knowledge and also the precise product information about everything you want. Exactly why must we
leave the good thing like a book Digital Futures: Expert Briefings on Digital Technologies for Education and
Research? A few of you have a different opinion about publication. But one aim that will book can give
many info for us. It is absolutely appropriate. Right now, try to closer using your book. Knowledge or facts
that you take for that, it is possible to give for each other; you could share all of these. Book Digital Futures:
Expert Briefings on Digital Technologies for Education and Research has simple shape but the truth is know:
it has great and big function for you. You can look the enormous world by available and read a book. So it is
very wonderful.

Stephanie Sellers:

The actual book Digital Futures: Expert Briefings on Digital Technologies for Education and Research will
bring someone to the new experience of reading a book. The author style to spell out the idea is very unique.
If you try to find new book you just read, this book very appropriate to you. The book Digital Futures:
Expert Briefings on Digital Technologies for Education and Research is much recommended to you to study.
You can also get the e-book through the official web site, so you can quickly to read the book.

Sharon Edwards:

Is it a person who having spare time in that case spend it whole day by means of watching television
programs or just telling lies on the bed? Do you need something new? This Digital Futures: Expert Briefings
on Digital Technologies for Education and Research can be the respond to, oh how comes? A book you
know. You are therefore out of date, spending your free time by reading in this new era is common not a
nerd activity. So what these publications have than the others?

Anthony Bankston:

Some individuals said that they feel fed up when they reading a publication. They are directly felt it when
they get a half portions of the book. You can choose often the book Digital Futures: Expert Briefings on
Digital Technologies for Education and Research to make your own reading is interesting. Your current skill
of reading expertise is developing when you similar to reading. Try to choose straightforward book to make
you enjoy to learn it and mingle the feeling about book and studying especially. It is to be 1st opinion for you
to like to wide open a book and examine it. Beside that the publication Digital Futures: Expert Briefings on
Digital Technologies for Education and Research can to be your brand-new friend when you're feel alone
and confuse with what must you're doing of their time.
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