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Sa'adyah Gaon was an outstanding 10th-century Jewish thinker - a prominent rabbi, philosopher, and
exegete. He was a pioneer in the fields in which he toiled, and was an inspiration and basis for later Jewish
writing in all these areas. The last major English-language study of his work was published in 1921, long
before Genizah research changed the understanding of the time in which he lived. Author Robert Brody's
masterly work, covering Sa'adyah's biography and his main areas of creativity, is therefore a much-needed
reassessment of an outstanding figure. The opening chapter - on the geonic period that formed the
background to Sa'adyah's life (a period on which there are few works in English) - is followed by an
overview that brings out the revolutionary aspects of his work and the characteristic features of his writings.
Subsequent chapters consider his philosophical works; his Bible commentaries; his pioneering linguistic
work; his poetry; his halakhic activity (including an examination of his use of the Palestinian Talmud
compared to that of the Babylonian Talmud); and his activity as a polemicist, notably against the Karaites.
An Epilogue sums up his importance in medieval Jewish culture. Particularly valuable features of the book
are the copious quotations from Sa'adyah's works, which facilitate familiarity with his style as well as his
ideas; the clarity in presenting complex and difficult concepts; the constant assessment of his relationship to
his predecessors in his various fields of study and his own unique contributions to each field; and the
contextualization of his contribution within the political, cultural, and religious climate of his times so that
both revolutionary and conservative elements in his thought can be identified and evaluated. *** " . . . Dr.
Brody does a good job balancing brevity with giving a non-superficial sense of Sa'adyah's thought. This is no
small feat given the breadth of Sa'adyah's concerns. The book succeeds in providing a portrait of Sa'adyah as
a man, at least in his role as public intellectual, with a deep sense of mission: rationalistic, religious, and
polemical. Recommended." - AJL Reviews, Vol. IV, No. 1, February/March 2014 *** "Sa'adyah was the
most influential rabbinic personality of the Geonic period whose broad influence on the development of the
Jewish tradition is still felt today. A biography of such a figure was much needed, and Brody's work fills this
lacuna. It's a fascinating work, about one of the most fascinating personalities in Jewish thought." - Ben
Rothke, The Times of Israel, June 2015 [Subject: Biography, Jewish Studies, Philosophy]Ëœ
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From reader reviews:

Dora Bair:

Have you spare time to get a day? What do you do when you have much more or little spare time? Yeah, you
can choose the suitable activity intended for spend your time. Any person spent their spare time to take a
walk, shopping, or went to the particular Mall. How about open or perhaps read a book entitled Sa'adyah
Gaon (Littman Library of Jewish Civilization)? Maybe it is for being best activity for you. You already know
beside you can spend your time with your favorite's book, you can smarter than before. Do you agree with it
has the opinion or you have various other opinion?

Juan Crowe:

The book Sa'adyah Gaon (Littman Library of Jewish Civilization) can give more knowledge and information
about everything you want. So why must we leave a good thing like a book Sa'adyah Gaon (Littman Library
of Jewish Civilization)? A number of you have a different opinion about e-book. But one aim that book can
give many data for us. It is absolutely appropriate. Right now, try to closer along with your book. Knowledge
or data that you take for that, you may give for each other; you can share all of these. Book Sa'adyah Gaon
(Littman Library of Jewish Civilization) has simple shape however, you know: it has great and massive
function for you. You can appearance the enormous world by wide open and read a guide. So it is very
wonderful.

April Cotton:

This Sa'adyah Gaon (Littman Library of Jewish Civilization) book is absolutely not ordinary book, you have
it then the world is in your hands. The benefit you receive by reading this book is actually information inside
this publication incredible fresh, you will get info which is getting deeper a person read a lot of information
you will get. This particular Sa'adyah Gaon (Littman Library of Jewish Civilization) without we know teach
the one who reading it become critical in considering and analyzing. Don't always be worry Sa'adyah Gaon
(Littman Library of Jewish Civilization) can bring if you are and not make your carrier space or bookshelves'
grow to be full because you can have it in the lovely laptop even cell phone. This Sa'adyah Gaon (Littman
Library of Jewish Civilization) having good arrangement in word as well as layout, so you will not feel
uninterested in reading.

Stephanie Hopkins:

This Sa'adyah Gaon (Littman Library of Jewish Civilization) are generally reliable for you who want to
become a successful person, why. The key reason why of this Sa'adyah Gaon (Littman Library of Jewish
Civilization) can be on the list of great books you must have is definitely giving you more than just simple
looking at food but feed anyone with information that probably will shock your earlier knowledge. This book
is usually handy, you can bring it just about everywhere and whenever your conditions in the e-book and
printed types. Beside that this Sa'adyah Gaon (Littman Library of Jewish Civilization) forcing you to have an



enormous of experience like rich vocabulary, giving you tryout of critical thinking that we all know it useful
in your day pastime. So , let's have it appreciate reading.
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