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Behan's friends and relatives, and people in his literary circle, have claimed he was not a prolific letter-
writer. Even Behan himself has been quoted as saying, "Whoever writes my biography will get no help from
my letters. I never write any." But in fact there is a substantial body of letters to and from Behan, who not
only corresponded with seventeen periodicals but wrote to relatives, friends, IRA colleagues, civil servants,
theatrical directors, publicans, and complete strangers. As in the case of Oscar Wilde, the search for Behan's
letters has been hampered by their dispersal to widely scattered and unexpected places. The surviving letters
that Mikhail was able to locate, however, proved well worth the trouble it took to uncover them. In addition
to providing a vital record of one of the giants of Irish literature, Behan's letters -- especially those written
without thought of publication -- give a far better sense of his exuberant verbal style than his plays or poetry.
Mikhail introduces each letter and explains the circumstances in which it was written. He also annotates the
letters, elucidating difficulties, noting the location and ownership of the letters whenever possible, and giving
biographical information about the correspondents. The Letters of Brendan Behan also includes four poems
that appear here for the first time, as well as extracts from early writings never before published. Numerous
letters to editors, refused publication because of their outspokenness, are published here for the first time,
and others, previously cut or censored, now appear in their original form. For anyone interested in Irish
literature or contemporary drama -- and especially for readers and scholars of Behan's work -- The Letters of
Brendan Behan is an invaluable collection.
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From reader reviews:

James Hill:

Now a day people who Living in the era everywhere everything reachable by match the internet and the
resources inside can be true or not call for people to be aware of each information they get. How individuals
to be smart in having any information nowadays? Of course the reply is reading a book. Studying a book can
help individuals out of this uncertainty Information particularly this The Letters of Brendan Behan book
because book offers you rich facts and knowledge. Of course the info in this book hundred pct guarantees
there is no doubt in it you probably know this.

Donald Jones:

In this era globalization it is important to someone to receive information. The information will make a
professional understand the condition of the world. The healthiness of the world makes the information
quicker to share. You can find a lot of references to get information example: internet, newspaper, book, and
soon. You will see that now, a lot of publisher which print many kinds of book. Often the book that
recommended for you is The Letters of Brendan Behan this book consist a lot of the information in the
condition of this world now. This book was represented how can the world has grown up. The terminology
styles that writer require to explain it is easy to understand. The writer made some research when he makes
this book. That is why this book suitable all of you.

Albert Shepherd:

Many people spending their time by playing outside along with friends, fun activity together with family or
just watching TV all day every day. You can have new activity to spend your whole day by reading a book.
Ugh, you think reading a book can actually hard because you have to accept the book everywhere? It ok you
can have the e-book, delivering everywhere you want in your Smart phone. Like The Letters of Brendan
Behan which is getting the e-book version. So , why not try out this book? Let's notice.

Donald Ventura:

Don't be worry should you be afraid that this book will probably filled the space in your house, you can have
it in e-book method, more simple and reachable. That The Letters of Brendan Behan can give you a lot of
buddies because by you investigating this one book you have point that they don't and make anyone more
like an interesting person. That book can be one of one step for you to get success. This publication offer you
information that probably your friend doesn't learn, by knowing more than various other make you to be
great folks. So , why hesitate? Let us have The Letters of Brendan Behan.
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