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These socks will keep you on your toes!

Jonelle Raffino and Katherine Cade are back with more toe-tapping designs in this follow-up to the best
selling Socks à la Carte. Create perfectly fitting pairs every time with toe-up construction and sizing tips
from the experts. Become a master sock designer by combining interchangeable foot, leg and cuff patterns to
create your own original designs. Perfect for sock mavens and beginners alike, Socks à la Carte 2 combines
design savvy with easy-to-follow instructions to knit eye-catching socks every time.

Inside you'll find:

Innovative flip pages: Preview your designs before you knit them by matching the foot, leg and cuff of●

your choice. See what your socks will look like before you knit them.
Easy tutorials: Clear, illustrated instructions guide you through the toe-up technique, specialized cast ons,●

sock sizing and more!
Thousands of design possibilities: Totally unique and personalized socks are possible with over 50 pattern●

options. Create literally thousands of different pairs!

Toe-up socks are easy with Socks à la Carte 2. Knit your perfect pair today!
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From reader reviews:

Levi Ryan:

Reading a e-book tends to be new life style in this particular era globalization. With reading through you can
get a lot of information that could give you benefit in your life. Together with book everyone in this world
could share their idea. Publications can also inspire a lot of people. Plenty of author can inspire their reader
with their story as well as their experience. Not only the storyplot that share in the textbooks. But also they
write about the knowledge about something that you need case in point. How to get the good score toefl, or
how to teach your children, there are many kinds of book that you can get now. The authors in this world
always try to improve their ability in writing, they also doing some analysis before they write to their book.
One of them is this Socks a La Carte 2: Toes Up!: Pick and Choose Patterns to Knit Socks Your Way.

Janet Thaxton:

Socks a La Carte 2: Toes Up!: Pick and Choose Patterns to Knit Socks Your Way can be one of your basic
books that are good idea. We recommend that straight away because this e-book has good vocabulary that
could increase your knowledge in words, easy to understand, bit entertaining but still delivering the
information. The article writer giving his/her effort that will put every word into enjoyment arrangement in
writing Socks a La Carte 2: Toes Up!: Pick and Choose Patterns to Knit Socks Your Way yet doesn't forget
the main position, giving the reader the hottest in addition to based confirm resource data that maybe you can
be considered one of it. This great information can easily drawn you into brand-new stage of crucial
considering.

Julie Gooch:

The book untitled Socks a La Carte 2: Toes Up!: Pick and Choose Patterns to Knit Socks Your Way contain
a lot of information on the idea. The writer explains your girlfriend idea with easy way. The language is very
clear to see all the people, so do not worry, you can easy to read it. The book was published by famous
author. The author will take you in the new era of literary works. You can actually read this book because
you can keep reading your smart phone, or model, so you can read the book inside anywhere and anytime. In
a situation you wish to purchase the e-book, you can wide open their official web-site and also order it. Have
a nice learn.

Barbara Robbins:

As we know that book is significant thing to add our understanding for everything. By a publication we can
know everything you want. A book is a range of written, printed, illustrated or perhaps blank sheet. Every
year was exactly added. This book Socks a La Carte 2: Toes Up!: Pick and Choose Patterns to Knit Socks
Your Way was filled concerning science. Spend your time to add your knowledge about your science
competence. Some people has various feel when they reading a book. If you know how big selling point of a
book, you can feel enjoy to read a e-book. In the modern era like currently, many ways to get book you



wanted.
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