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Who was the real Karl Marx?

In the Western world, and especially in the United States, Karl Marx is perceived as the spiritual godfather of
Lenin and Stalin—someone bent on creating a state where everyone worships a centralized bureaucracy.
Social philosopher Erich Fromm argues that Marx has been entirely misrepresented and misunderstood, and
that Marx’s ideas have been misappropriated to further causes antithetical to his true intentions.
 
Fromm’s study presents Marx as a humanist and social scientist. Painstakingly traveling through Marx’s
oeuvre, Fromm shows how Marx’s real goal was to eliminate man’s alienation, and allow individuals to live
and appreciate a life of freedom. Furthermore, Fromm believes, Marx would have considered the Communist
governments of Russia and Cuba as wrong-headed. Marx’s Concept of Man also includes a selection of
Marx’s Early Writings, brought to English-speaking readers for the first time in 1961.
 
This ebook features an illustrated biography of Erich Fromm, with rare images and never-before-seen
documents from the author’s estate.
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From reader reviews:

Paul Holt:

The book Marx's Concept of Man make you feel enjoy for your spare time. You may use to make your
capable a lot more increase. Book can for being your best friend when you getting anxiety or having big
problem using your subject. If you can make studying a book Marx's Concept of Man to be your habit, you
can get considerably more advantages, like add your current capable, increase your knowledge about several
or all subjects. You are able to know everything if you like open up and read a book Marx's Concept of Man.
Kinds of book are a lot of. It means that, science book or encyclopedia or other folks. So , how do you think
about this e-book?

Wanda Stamper:

This book untitled Marx's Concept of Man to be one of several books which best seller in this year, that's
because when you read this reserve you can get a lot of benefit upon it. You will easily to buy this kind of
book in the book shop or you can order it by using online. The publisher with this book sells the e-book too.
It makes you easier to read this book, since you can read this book in your Smart phone. So there is no
reason to your account to past this e-book from your list.

Rick Briones:

The reserve untitled Marx's Concept of Man is the reserve that recommended to you you just read. You can
see the quality of the e-book content that will be shown to anyone. The language that article author use to
explained their way of doing something is easily to understand. The author was did a lot of study when write
the book, hence the information that they share to you is absolutely accurate. You also will get the e-book of
Marx's Concept of Man from the publisher to make you much more enjoy free time.

Jonathan Sanders:

Exactly why? Because this Marx's Concept of Man is an unordinary book that the inside of the publication
waiting for you to snap the item but latter it will shock you with the secret that inside. Reading this book
beside it was fantastic author who else write the book in such remarkable way makes the content within
easier to understand, entertaining approach but still convey the meaning totally. So , it is good for you
because of not hesitating having this any longer or you going to regret it. This phenomenal book will give
you a lot of advantages than the other book include such as help improving your ability and your critical
thinking approach. So , still want to hold off having that book? If I ended up you I will go to the e-book store
hurriedly.
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