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The growth of Las Vegas that began in the 1940s brought an influx of both women and men looking to work
in the expanding hotel and casino industries. In fact, for the next fifty years the proportion of women in the
labor force was greater in Las Vegas than the United States as a whole. Joanne L. Goodwin’s study captures
the shifting boundaries of women’s employment in the postwar decades with narratives drawn from the Las
Vegas Women Oral History Project. It counters clichéd pictures of women at work in the famed resort city as
it explores women’s real strategies for economic survival and success.

Their experiences anticipated major trends in post-World War II labor history: the national migration of
workers during and after the war, the growing proportion of women in the labor force, balancing work with
family life, the unionization of service workers, and, above all, the desegregation of the labor force by sex
and race. These narratives show women in Las Vegas resisting preassigned roles, seeing their work as a
testimony of skill, a measure of independence, and a fulfillment of needs. Overall, these stories of women
who lived and worked in Las Vegas in the last half of the twentieth century reveal much about the broader
transitions for women in America between 1940 and 1990.
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From reader reviews:

Danielle Rhodes:

Spent a free a chance to be fun activity to try and do! A lot of people spent their spare time with their family,
or all their friends. Usually they undertaking activity like watching television, about to beach, or picnic
inside park. They actually doing same task every week. Do you feel it? Would you like to something
different to fill your own personal free time/ holiday? Might be reading a book can be option to fill your free
time/ holiday. The first thing that you'll ask may be what kinds of publication that you should read. If you
want to consider look for book, may be the reserve untitled Changing the Game: Women at Work in Las
Vegas, 1940-1990 (Shepperson Series in Nevada History) can be great book to read. May be it may be best
activity to you.

Gertrude Barrett:

Playing with family in a very park, coming to see the coastal world or hanging out with pals is thing that
usually you might have done when you have spare time, subsequently why you don't try issue that really
opposite from that. A single activity that make you not experience tired but still relaxing, trilling like on
roller coaster you have been ride on and with addition associated with. Even you love Changing the Game:
Women at Work in Las Vegas, 1940-1990 (Shepperson Series in Nevada History), you could enjoy both. It
is good combination right, you still need to miss it? What kind of hangout type is it? Oh occur its mind
hangout people. What? Still don't buy it, oh come on its known as reading friends.

Jesse Fox:

Beside this particular Changing the Game: Women at Work in Las Vegas, 1940-1990 (Shepperson Series in
Nevada History) in your phone, it could possibly give you a way to get more close to the new knowledge or
info. The information and the knowledge you may got here is fresh in the oven so don't become worry if you
feel like an aged people live in narrow commune. It is good thing to have Changing the Game: Women at
Work in Las Vegas, 1940-1990 (Shepperson Series in Nevada History) because this book offers to you
personally readable information. Do you oftentimes have book but you would not get what it's all about. Oh
come on, that would not happen if you have this in the hand. The Enjoyable blend here cannot be
questionable, like treasuring beautiful island. Use you still want to miss that? Find this book as well as read it
from today!

Lydia Baum:

As a college student exactly feel bored to be able to reading. If their teacher asked them to go to the library in
order to make summary for some e-book, they are complained. Just very little students that has reading's
internal or real their passion. They just do what the instructor want, like asked to the library. They go to there
but nothing reading significantly. Any students feel that reading is not important, boring as well as can't see
colorful pics on there. Yeah, it is for being complicated. Book is very important in your case. As we know



that on this age, many ways to get whatever we wish. Likewise word says, ways to reach Chinese's country.
Therefore , this Changing the Game: Women at Work in Las Vegas, 1940-1990 (Shepperson Series in
Nevada History) can make you sense more interested to read.
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