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Every fossil tells a story. Best-selling paleontology author Donald R. Prothero describes twenty-five famous,
beautifully preserved fossils in a gripping, scientific history of life on Earth. Recounting the adventures
behind the discovery of these objects and fully interpreting their significance within the larger fossil record,
Prothero creates a riveting and enlightening overview for anyone interested in the history of life on our
planet.

The twenty-five fossils lovingly portrayed in this book catch animals in their evolutionary splendor as they
transition from one kind of organism to another. We witness extinct plants and animals of microscopic and
immense size and thrilling diversity. We learn about fantastic land and sea creatures that have no match in
nature today. Along the way, we encounter such fascinating fossils as the earliest trilobite, Olenellus; the
giant shark Carcharocles; the "Frogamander" and the "Turtle on the Half Shell"; the "fishibian" Tiktalik; the
first bird, Archaeopteryx; the walking whale Ambulocetus; enormous marine reptiles and the biggest
dinosaurs known; the gigantic hornless rhinoceros Paraceratherium, the largest land mammal that ever
lived; and the Australopithecus nicknamed "Lucy," the oldest human skeleton. We learn about the scientists
and adventurers who pioneered paleontology and the larger intellectual and social contexts in which their
discoveries were made. Finally, we are told where to see these splendid fossils in the world's great museums.
Ideal for all who love prehistoric landscapes and delight in the history of science, Prothero's new book will
be a treasured addition to any bookshelf, stoking curiosity in the evolution and life on Earth.
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From reader reviews:

Joan Rogers:

The ability that you get from The Story of Life in 25 Fossils: Tales of Intrepid Fossil Hunters and the
Wonders of Evolution will be the more deep you searching the information that hide inside the words the
more you get interested in reading it. It doesn't mean that this book is hard to understand but The Story of
Life in 25 Fossils: Tales of Intrepid Fossil Hunters and the Wonders of Evolution giving you joy feeling of
reading. The copy writer conveys their point in particular way that can be understood by anyone who read
the item because the author of this guide is well-known enough. This kind of book also makes your own
personal vocabulary increase well. Making it easy to understand then can go along, both in printed or e-book
style are available. We highly recommend you for having this specific The Story of Life in 25 Fossils: Tales
of Intrepid Fossil Hunters and the Wonders of Evolution instantly.

Cecil Andrade:

Information is provisions for anyone to get better life, information nowadays can get by anyone in
everywhere. The information can be a knowledge or any news even an issue. What people must be consider
while those information which is from the former life are challenging be find than now is taking seriously
which one is appropriate to believe or which one the particular resource are convinced. If you obtain the
unstable resource then you get it as your main information there will be huge disadvantage for you. All those
possibilities will not happen inside you if you take The Story of Life in 25 Fossils: Tales of Intrepid Fossil
Hunters and the Wonders of Evolution as the daily resource information.

Marlyn Melia:

Beside this kind of The Story of Life in 25 Fossils: Tales of Intrepid Fossil Hunters and the Wonders of
Evolution in your phone, it could give you a way to get more close to the new knowledge or facts. The
information and the knowledge you may got here is fresh through the oven so don't always be worry if you
feel like an outdated people live in narrow town. It is good thing to have The Story of Life in 25 Fossils:
Tales of Intrepid Fossil Hunters and the Wonders of Evolution because this book offers for your
requirements readable information. Do you often have book but you don't get what it's all about. Oh come
on, that will not happen if you have this in the hand. The Enjoyable arrangement here cannot be
questionable, including treasuring beautiful island. Techniques you still want to miss this? Find this book as
well as read it from today!

Yolanda Nitta:

Reading a book make you to get more knowledge from it. You can take knowledge and information
originating from a book. Book is prepared or printed or outlined from each source which filled update of
news. On this modern era like at this point, many ways to get information are available for you actually.
From media social including newspaper, magazines, science reserve, encyclopedia, reference book, novel



and comic. You can add your understanding by that book. Are you ready to spend your spare time to open
your book? Or just in search of the The Story of Life in 25 Fossils: Tales of Intrepid Fossil Hunters and the
Wonders of Evolution when you needed it?
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