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A Jewish factory worker is falsely accused of ritually murdering a Christian boy in Russia in 1911, and his
trial becomes an international cause célèbre.
 
On March 20, 1911, thirteen-year-old Andrei Yushchinsky was found stabbed to death in a cave on the
outskirts of Kiev. Four months later, Russian police arrested Mendel Beilis, a thirty-seven-year-old father of
five who worked as a clerk in a brick factory nearby, and charged him not only with Andrei’s murder but
also with the Jewish ritual murder of a Christian child. Despite the fact that there was no evidence linking
him to the crime, that he had a solid alibi, and that his main accuser was a professional criminal who was
herself under suspicion for the murder, Beilis was imprisoned for more than two years before being brought
to trial. As a handful of Russian officials and journalists diligently searched for the real killer, the rabid anti-
Semites known as the Black Hundreds whipped into a frenzy men and women throughout the Russian
Empire who firmly believed that this was only the latest example of centuries of Jewish ritual murder of
Christian children—the age-old blood libel.
 
With the full backing of Tsar Nicholas II’s teetering government, the prosecution called an array of “expert
witnesses”—pathologists, a theologian, a psychological profiler—whose laughably incompetent testimony
horrified liberal Russians and brought to Beilis’s side an array of international supporters who included
Thomas Mann, H. G. Wells, Anatole France, Arthur Conan Doyle, the archbishop of Canterbury, and Jane
Addams. The jury’s split verdict allowed both sides to claim victory: they agreed with the prosecution’s
description of the wounds on the boy’s body—a description that was worded to imply a ritual murder—but
they determined that Beilis was not the murderer. After the fall of the Romanovs in 1917, a renewed effort to
find Andrei’s killer was not successful; in recent years his grave has become a pilgrimage site for those
convinced that the boy was murdered by a Jew so that his blood could be used in making Passover matzo.
Visitors today will find it covered with flowers.

(With 24 pages of black-and-white illustrations.)

From the Hardcover edition.
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From reader reviews:

Anthony Youngblood:

Now a day people who Living in the era exactly where everything reachable by match the internet and the
resources inside can be true or not involve people to be aware of each facts they get. How a lot more to be
smart in acquiring any information nowadays? Of course the answer is reading a book. Reading through a
book can help people out of this uncertainty Information specifically this A Child of Christian Blood:
Murder and Conspiracy in Tsarist Russia: The Beilis Blood Libel book since this book offers you rich facts
and knowledge. Of course the details in this book hundred per cent guarantees there is no doubt in it you
probably know this.

Paul Douglas:

People live in this new morning of lifestyle always make an effort to and must have the spare time or they
will get lot of stress from both daily life and work. So , once we ask do people have free time, we will say
absolutely yes. People is human not really a robot. Then we inquire again, what kind of activity do you
possess when the spare time coming to an individual of course your answer will unlimited right. Then do you
try this one, reading textbooks. It can be your alternative inside spending your spare time, the particular book
you have read is actually A Child of Christian Blood: Murder and Conspiracy in Tsarist Russia: The Beilis
Blood Libel.

Kenneth Harrell:

The book untitled A Child of Christian Blood: Murder and Conspiracy in Tsarist Russia: The Beilis Blood
Libel contain a lot of information on the item. The writer explains your girlfriend idea with easy technique.
The language is very clear and understandable all the people, so do definitely not worry, you can easy to read
the idea. The book was published by famous author. The author brings you in the new age of literary works.
It is easy to read this book because you can keep reading your smart phone, or model, so you can read the
book with anywhere and anytime. If you want to buy the e-book, you can start their official web-site along
with order it. Have a nice go through.

Elaine Sitz:

On this era which is the greater man or woman or who has ability to do something more are more treasured
than other. Do you want to become certainly one of it? It is just simple strategy to have that. What you
should do is just spending your time not very much but quite enough to get a look at some books. One of
several books in the top record in your reading list is definitely A Child of Christian Blood: Murder and
Conspiracy in Tsarist Russia: The Beilis Blood Libel. This book which is qualified as The Hungry
Mountains can get you closer in turning into precious person. By looking up and review this guide you can
get many advantages.
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