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Fareham Revisited started out as a poem, which Michael Stephenson was inspired to write when he was
reflecting on how much his home town had changed since the 1950s and 1960s. The poem and its sentiments
struck a chord with so many people that he decided to write a book about Fareham that would evoke more of
these memories. The book was privately published in 2004. This new revised and expanded edition will
delight anyone who remembers the town in its heyday - and will also intrigue newcomers. Part-memoir and
part-history, Fareham Revisited perfectly captures the allure of the shops and cafés along the ‘Golden Mile’,
the alleyways or ‘drokes’, the old cottages, the market with its livestock, the coal barges at the Quay and the
well-known characters, including dairy boss Tom Parker who drove around Fareham in a four-horse-power
carriage, though his milkmen still used the horse-and-cart. For bus and railway enthusiasts this, too, is the
perfect book, as the author casts an expert eye on the bus companies that plied their trade in Fareham, with
their distinctive livery, and remembers the last days of steam trains, of which he had a privileged view, as the
house in which his family lived was next to the railway line.
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From reader reviews:

Lewis Wood:

The book Fareham Revisited can give more knowledge and information about everything you want. So just
why must we leave the great thing like a book Fareham Revisited? Several of you have a different opinion
about book. But one aim this book can give many info for us. It is absolutely suitable. Right now, try to
closer using your book. Knowledge or info that you take for that, you can give for each other; you could
share all of these. Book Fareham Revisited has simple shape but you know: it has great and large function
for you. You can appearance the enormous world by wide open and read a publication. So it is very
wonderful.

Robert Bell:

In this 21st one hundred year, people become competitive in every way. By being competitive currently,
people have do something to make these survives, being in the middle of the particular crowded place and
notice by means of surrounding. One thing that occasionally many people have underestimated the idea for a
while is reading. Yes, by reading a reserve your ability to survive boost then having chance to remain than
other is high. To suit your needs who want to start reading any book, we give you this Fareham Revisited
book as beginning and daily reading publication. Why, because this book is greater than just a book.

Michael Farrell:

Precisely why? Because this Fareham Revisited is an unordinary book that the inside of the guide waiting for
you to snap this but latter it will zap you with the secret that inside. Reading this book close to it was
fantastic author who all write the book in such awesome way makes the content on the inside easier to
understand, entertaining method but still convey the meaning entirely. So , it is good for you for not
hesitating having this anymore or you going to regret it. This excellent book will give you a lot of benefits
than the other book have such as help improving your skill and your critical thinking means. So , still want to
postpone having that book? If I had been you I will go to the guide store hurriedly.

Helene Anderson:

A number of people said that they feel bored when they reading a book. They are directly felt it when they
get a half regions of the book. You can choose the particular book Fareham Revisited to make your current
reading is interesting. Your current skill of reading skill is developing when you like reading. Try to choose
simple book to make you enjoy to see it and mingle the opinion about book and studying especially. It is to
be initial opinion for you to like to open up a book and go through it. Beside that the publication Fareham
Revisited can to be your brand-new friend when you're feel alone and confuse with the information must
you're doing of that time.
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