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When historians are asked to list the most influential people of the last 200 years, a handful of names might
vary, but there is no question that the list will include Napoleon Bonaparte (1769-1821), the most successful
French leader since Charlemagne and widely acknowledged one of the greatest generals ever. Indeed,
Napoleon was likely the most influential man of the 19th century, leaving an indelible mark on everything
from the strategy and tactics of warfare to the Napoleonic Code that drafted laws across the continent. To
defeat Napoleon, the Europeans had to form large coalitions multiple times, which helped bring about the
entangling alliances that sparked World War I after Europe was rebuilt following Waterloo and the Congress
of Vienna. Napoleon’s influence on the United States was also palpable. To finance his endeavors, he struck
a deal with President Thomas Jefferson that became the Louisiana Purchase, and it was Napoleonic warfare
that was used throughout the Civil War, leading to massive casualties because the weaponry of the 1860s
was now more advanced than the tactics of 1815.

When Napoleon died at St. Helena, he still engendered fear and distaste among the Europeans, but the man
and his legacy continued to be held in awe across the world. In Napoleon’s time, emperors and leaders still
hoped to become the next Julius Caesar. After the Napoleonic Era, emperors and generals hoped to become
the next Napoleon. For the next century, military leaders and even civilians struck Napoleonic poses when
having their pictures taken, and phrases like “Napoleonic complex” and “meeting one’s Waterloo” are now
common phrases in the English lexicon. It would be truly impossible to envision or understand geopolitics in
the West over the last two centuries without Napoleon.

With the passage of time, Napoleon’s legacy has had time to crystallize, but the legends, myths, and
controversies about the man and his empire continue to swirl. Was he really short? Did his men shoot the
nose off the Sphinx? Was he a good chess player? Was he poisoned by the British? In the rush to analyze his
stunningly successful military record or question whether he was very short or a great chess player, people
often overlook his political reign and personality.
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From reader reviews:

Susan Burroughs:

Within other case, little men and women like to read book The Life of Napoleon. You can choose the best
book if you like reading a book. Providing we know about how is important any book The Life of Napoleon.
You can add expertise and of course you can around the world with a book. Absolutely right, simply because
from book you can recognize everything! From your country till foreign or abroad you will end up known.
About simple matter until wonderful thing it is possible to know that. In this era, we could open a book or
even searching by internet gadget. It is called e-book. You may use it when you feel bored to go to the
library. Let's learn.

Miguel Philip:

Book is to be different per grade. Book for children until finally adult are different content. We all know that
that book is very important for us. The book The Life of Napoleon has been making you to know about other
understanding and of course you can take more information. It is very advantages for you. The book The
Life of Napoleon is not only giving you much more new information but also to become your friend when
you really feel bored. You can spend your own spend time to read your book. Try to make relationship while
using book The Life of Napoleon. You never experience lose out for everything in case you read some
books.

Debra Sims:

Information is provisions for folks to get better life, information nowadays can get by anyone on everywhere.
The information can be a understanding or any news even a concern. What people must be consider when
those information which is inside former life are challenging to be find than now could be taking seriously
which one is suitable to believe or which one often the resource are convinced. If you receive the unstable
resource then you understand it as your main information there will be huge disadvantage for you. All of
those possibilities will not happen inside you if you take The Life of Napoleon as the daily resource
information.

Rodney Bell:

Are you kind of hectic person, only have 10 or even 15 minute in your day to upgrading your mind
proficiency or thinking skill actually analytical thinking? Then you are experiencing problem with the book
than can satisfy your small amount of time to read it because pretty much everything time you only find
publication that need more time to be examine. The Life of Napoleon can be your answer since it can be read
by an individual who have those short free time problems.
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