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A teen develops a gambling addiction in this risk-heavy read—in trade paperback for the first time.

Sixteen-year-old Denn Doyle’s troubles begin with a seemingly harmless—and extremely profitable—game
of poker with some neighborhood kids. Eager to join the adult world, Denn realizes that casinos and poker
are a means to do exactly that. His “hobby” progresses to a habit and then to an addiction that threatens
relationships with his parents, girlfriend, and best friend. Hautman explores the escalation of Denn’s
gambling without preachiness, dealing with his problem in a straightforward and knowledgeable manner.
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From reader reviews:

Mack Washburn:

What do you consider book? It is just for students since they're still students or that for all people in the
world, what best subject for that? Just you can be answered for that problem above. Every person has various
personality and hobby for each and every other. Don't to be pressured someone or something that they don't
wish do that. You must know how great as well as important the book No Limit. All type of book can you
see on many options. You can look for the internet resources or other social media.

Steven Bemis:

The e-book untitled No Limit is the book that recommended to you to study. You can see the quality of the
e-book content that will be shown to anyone. The language that article author use to explained their way of
doing something is easily to understand. The copy writer was did a lot of investigation when write the book,
so the information that they share to you personally is absolutely accurate. You also can get the e-book of No
Limit from the publisher to make you much more enjoy free time.

Melissa Jackson:

Your reading 6th sense will not betray anyone, why because this No Limit book written by well-known
writer who really knows well how to make book that could be understand by anyone who have read the
book. Written in good manner for you, leaking every ideas and publishing skill only for eliminate your
personal hunger then you still hesitation No Limit as good book but not only by the cover but also by the
content. This is one reserve that can break don't ascertain book by its protect, so do you still needing yet
another sixth sense to pick that!? Oh come on your looking at sixth sense already said so why you have to
listening to an additional sixth sense.

Juanita Hernandez:

Do you like reading a reserve? Confuse to looking for your favorite book? Or your book ended up being
rare? Why so many issue for the book? But virtually any people feel that they enjoy to get reading. Some
people likes looking at, not only science book but also novel and No Limit or others sources were given
understanding for you. After you know how the great a book, you feel want to read more and more. Science
book was created for teacher or maybe students especially. Those ebooks are helping them to put their
knowledge. In different case, beside science book, any other book likes No Limit to make your spare time
more colorful. Many types of book like this one.
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