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The Promise of Love for a Lifetime

God alone knows fully the hopes and dreams that nestle within the hearts of two souls who promise to honor
and cherish one another “for better, for worse, for richer, for poorer, in sickness and in health, till death do us
part.” And He also knows that only a firm commitment to those vows will fulfill their dreams for a lifetime
of love.

In this engaging book, author Claire Cloninger reflects on the promises a couple makes on their wedding day
and explores what those words really mean when it comes to the daily grind and unanticipated difficulties of
life. Along the way, she shares the inspiring stories of numerous real-life couples whose commitment to
those vows has bound them together through staggering challenges and drawn them toward a love that grows
deeper with each passing year.

With a refreshing blend of wisdom and humor, Making “I Do” Last a Lifetime will show you how to nurture
your own romance and keep the passion burning all the way to forever.

From the Hardcover edition.
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From reader reviews:

Stephen Ziegler:

Why don't make it to be your habit? Right now, try to ready your time to do the important behave, like
looking for your favorite reserve and reading a book. Beside you can solve your short lived problem; you can
add your knowledge by the reserve entitled Making "I Do" Last a Lifetime. Try to make book Making "I Do"
Last a Lifetime as your good friend. It means that it can to be your friend when you really feel alone and
beside those of course make you smarter than ever before. Yeah, it is very fortuned for you. The book makes
you more confidence because you can know every thing by the book. So , let's make new experience along
with knowledge with this book.

Rosalyn Kendall:

What do you think about book? It is just for students because they're still students or it for all people in the
world, the particular best subject for that? Merely you can be answered for that problem above. Every person
has distinct personality and hobby for each and every other. Don't to be forced someone or something that
they don't need do that. You must know how great and important the book Making "I Do" Last a Lifetime.
All type of book is it possible to see on many methods. You can look for the internet options or other social
media.

Marie Daugherty:

In this period of time globalization it is important to someone to acquire information. The information will
make professionals understand the condition of the world. The health of the world makes the information
simpler to share. You can find a lot of recommendations to get information example: internet, newspapers,
book, and soon. You can see that now, a lot of publisher in which print many kinds of book. The book that
recommended to you personally is Making "I Do" Last a Lifetime this book consist a lot of the information
of the condition of this world now. This specific book was represented just how can the world has grown up.
The language styles that writer value to explain it is easy to understand. Often the writer made some research
when he makes this book. Honestly, that is why this book suitable all of you.

Belinda Bridges:

Reading a reserve make you to get more knowledge from that. You can take knowledge and information
originating from a book. Book is created or printed or highlighted from each source which filled update of
news. On this modern era like right now, many ways to get information are available for you actually. From
media social similar to newspaper, magazines, science guide, encyclopedia, reference book, new and comic.
You can add your understanding by that book. Are you ready to spend your spare time to open your book?
Or just looking for the Making "I Do" Last a Lifetime when you desired it?
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