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Bread and Butter is a book with three parts: First, it's the story of the birth of an extraordinarily successful
kind of business called a "freedom franchise": Great Harvest Bread Co., which began as one bakery 25 years
ago, is now a $60-million-a-year company with 140 stores in 40 states.

Second, it's the story of one employee's success--the author, Tom McMakin, who was looking for a job and
found a lifestyle. McMakin's immersion into Great Harvest is a model for modern entrepreneurship and an
inspiration in this age of failed dot-coms and dissatisfied young employees.

Third, McMakin uses GH's experience to provide advice for everyone from dreamers starting their own
multi-million-dollar companies to small-business owners to someone who doesn't know what she wants to
do. Things like: creating a "learning community" using email and an extranet; operating without loans,
relying instead on profits for reinvesting in the company; GH's "40-hour" rule so no one works more than 40
hours a week; and more. Bread and Butter can help you discover how, instead of living your life in service to
the business, you can create a business in service of your life.
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From reader reviews:

Scott Barbour:

What do you think about book? It is just for students because they're still students or the item for all people
in the world, the actual best subject for that? Just simply you can be answered for that problem above. Every
person has distinct personality and hobby for every single other. Don't to be pushed someone or something
that they don't need do that. You must know how great and important the book Bread and Butter: What a
Bunch of Bakers Taught Me About Business and Happiness. All type of book could you see on many
methods. You can look for the internet methods or other social media.

Donovan Houseman:

Typically the book Bread and Butter: What a Bunch of Bakers Taught Me About Business and Happiness
will bring that you the new experience of reading some sort of book. The author style to explain the idea is
very unique. Should you try to find new book to read, this book very suited to you. The book Bread and
Butter: What a Bunch of Bakers Taught Me About Business and Happiness is much recommended to you to
see. You can also get the e-book in the official web site, so you can quicker to read the book.

Daniel Moore:

Beside this specific Bread and Butter: What a Bunch of Bakers Taught Me About Business and Happiness in
your phone, it might give you a way to get more close to the new knowledge or info. The information and the
knowledge you can got here is fresh through the oven so don't become worry if you feel like an old people
live in narrow village. It is good thing to have Bread and Butter: What a Bunch of Bakers Taught Me About
Business and Happiness because this book offers for you readable information. Do you at times have book
but you seldom get what it's about. Oh come on, that will not happen if you have this with your hand. The
Enjoyable agreement here cannot be questionable, such as treasuring beautiful island. So do you still want to
miss the idea? Find this book along with read it from right now!

Irene Carpenter:

With this era which is the greater man or woman or who has ability to do something more are more precious
than other. Do you want to become considered one of it? It is just simple method to have that. What you
must do is just spending your time almost no but quite enough to have a look at some books. One of many
books in the top collection in your reading list is actually Bread and Butter: What a Bunch of Bakers Taught
Me About Business and Happiness. This book which is qualified as The Hungry Hillsides can get you closer
in turning out to be precious person. By looking upward and review this publication you can get many
advantages.
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