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High Resolution NMR: Theory and Chemical Applications, Second Edition covers the significant progress in
understanding the NMR phenomena, instrumentation, and applications in chemical and biochemistry.

This edition is divided into 14 chapters and begins with the historical developments and theoretical aspects
of NMR. Considerable chapters are devoted to the basic principles, chemical shifts, coupling constants, and
analysis of complex spectra. Other chapters contain expanded topics on carbon-13, nuclear Overhauser
effect, relaxation mechanisms, and the use of superconducting magnets. The remaining chapters examine the
concepts of solvent effects, hydrogen bonding, and the use of NMR in quantitative analysis.

This book will prove useful to analytical chemists, biochemists, and researchers.
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From reader reviews:

Preston Sloan:

Throughout other case, little persons like to read book High Resolution NMR: Theory and Chemical
Applications. You can choose the best book if you'd prefer reading a book. So long as we know about how is
important any book High Resolution NMR: Theory and Chemical Applications. You can add information
and of course you can around the world by way of a book. Absolutely right, simply because from book you
can recognize everything! From your country until eventually foreign or abroad you will end up known.
About simple thing until wonderful thing you could know that. In this era, we can easily open a book or
perhaps searching by internet system. It is called e-book. You need to use it when you feel weary to go to the
library. Let's examine.

Brandy Brobst:

The book High Resolution NMR: Theory and Chemical Applications make you feel enjoy for your spare
time. You should use to make your capable a lot more increase. Book can for being your best friend when
you getting pressure or having big problem using your subject. If you can make looking at a book High
Resolution NMR: Theory and Chemical Applications being your habit, you can get much more advantages,
like add your own personal capable, increase your knowledge about a number of or all subjects. You may
know everything if you like start and read a e-book High Resolution NMR: Theory and Chemical
Applications. Kinds of book are a lot of. It means that, science book or encyclopedia or other individuals. So
, how do you think about this publication?

Adam Mathews:

Book is to be different per grade. Book for children till adult are different content. As you may know that
book is very important for us. The book High Resolution NMR: Theory and Chemical Applications seemed
to be making you to know about other know-how and of course you can take more information. It is rather
advantages for you. The e-book High Resolution NMR: Theory and Chemical Applications is not only
giving you much more new information but also to get your friend when you sense bored. You can spend
your spend time to read your book. Try to make relationship with the book High Resolution NMR: Theory
and Chemical Applications. You never feel lose out for everything when you read some books.

William McCoy:

Are you kind of occupied person, only have 10 or maybe 15 minute in your morning to upgrading your mind
proficiency or thinking skill possibly analytical thinking? Then you are experiencing problem with the book
compared to can satisfy your small amount of time to read it because pretty much everything time you only
find e-book that need more time to be learn. High Resolution NMR: Theory and Chemical Applications can
be your answer as it can be read by a person who have those short free time problems.
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