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The Web has become a rich source of personal information in the last few years. People twitter, blog, and
chat online. Current feelings, experiences or latest news are posted. For instance, first hints to disease
outbreaks, customer preferences, or political changes could be identified with this data.

Surveillance or early warning systems enable such detection of changes and support humans in getting
information on changing situations. However, the variety of data that could be considered for surveillance is
immense, ranging from sensor-measured values to collected counts and information extracted from natural
language documents.

Denecke’s objective is to introduce the multiple possibilities and facets of surveillance and its applications.
She first introduces the task of surveillance and provides an overview on surveillance in various domains.
Next, the various information sources that are available and could already be used by surveillance systems
are summarized. In the main part of the book, her focus is on unstructured data as a source for surveillance.
An overview on existing methods as well as methods to be developed in order to process this kind of data
with respect to surveillance is presented. As an example application, she introduces disease surveillance
using Web 2.0, including corresponding methods and challenges to be addressed. The book closes with
remarks on new possibilities for surveillance gained by recent developments of the Internet and mobile
communication, and with an outline of future challenges.
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From reader reviews:

Dorcas Starling:

As people who live in the modest era should be change about what going on or information even knowledge
to make these people keep up with the era and that is always change and move ahead. Some of you maybe
will probably update themselves by looking at books. It is a good choice for you personally but the problems
coming to a person is you don't know which you should start with. This Event-Driven Surveillance:
Possibilities and Challenges: 0 (SpringerBriefs in Computer Science) is our recommendation so you keep up
with the world. Why, because book serves what you want and need in this era.

Earnest Jennings:

Reading a book can be one of a lot of action that everyone in the world really likes. Do you like reading book
thus. There are a lot of reasons why people enjoy it. First reading a book will give you a lot of new data.
When you read a e-book you will get new information since book is one of various ways to share the
information or perhaps their idea. Second, reading through a book will make anyone more imaginative.
When you reading a book especially hype book the author will bring that you imagine the story how the
character types do it anything. Third, you are able to share your knowledge to some others. When you read
this Event-Driven Surveillance: Possibilities and Challenges: 0 (SpringerBriefs in Computer Science), you
could tells your family, friends as well as soon about yours reserve. Your knowledge can inspire others,
make them reading a reserve.

Brent Campbell:

The reason why? Because this Event-Driven Surveillance: Possibilities and Challenges: 0 (SpringerBriefs in
Computer Science) is an unordinary book that the inside of the guide waiting for you to snap that but latter it
will shock you with the secret the idea inside. Reading this book alongside it was fantastic author who have
write the book in such amazing way makes the content interior easier to understand, entertaining method but
still convey the meaning thoroughly. So , it is good for you for not hesitating having this any more or you
going to regret it. This excellent book will give you a lot of benefits than the other book include such as help
improving your skill and your critical thinking approach. So , still want to postpone having that book? If I
had been you I will go to the book store hurriedly.

Tommy Bowles:

Do you one of the book lovers? If so, do you ever feeling doubt while you are in the book store? Attempt to
pick one book that you find out the inside because don't ascertain book by its cover may doesn't work is
difficult job because you are afraid that the inside maybe not as fantastic as in the outside look likes. Maybe
you answer could be Event-Driven Surveillance: Possibilities and Challenges: 0 (SpringerBriefs in Computer
Science) why because the great cover that make you consider concerning the content will not disappoint a
person. The inside or content is definitely fantastic as the outside or perhaps cover. Your reading sixth sense



will directly guide you to pick up this book.
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