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Research Paper from the year 2009 in the subject Business economics - Business Management, Corporate
Governance, grade: 1,7, Furtwangen University; Villingen-Schwenningen, language: English, abstract: Art
shop “Avocadi” is an art and souvenir shop, situated in Hungarian town of Szentendre. Hungary is in 17th
place ranking of World’s Top tourism destinations The place is carefully selected as it is only 20 kilometers
from Budapest on the bank of the River Danube. The ancient houses, churches and traditions of its various
ethnic groups so carefully preserved in this atmospheric small town have made it a popular destination for
excursions. Located in the heart of Szentendre, art shop “Avocadi” will attract both tourists and locals.
Because in all travel agencies’ programs visit to Szentendre is included (either by bus or boat), a large
amount of tourists visiting Budapest spend a few couples of hours in Szentendre. Due to its internationally
famed artists' colony as well as its numerous museums and galleries it is both a city of the living arts and a
true tourist favorites.
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From reader reviews:

Dick McAlister:

Do you have favorite book? If you have, what is your favorite's book? Book is very important thing for us to
understand everything in the world. Each book has different aim or even goal; it means that e-book has
different type. Some people experience enjoy to spend their a chance to read a book. These are reading
whatever they get because their hobby is usually reading a book. Think about the person who don't like
examining a book? Sometime, individual feel need book if they found difficult problem or exercise. Well,
probably you will require this Business Plan for an Art and Souvenir Shop.

Clara Reece:

The book Business Plan for an Art and Souvenir Shop can give more knowledge and also the precise product
information about everything you want. So just why must we leave the good thing like a book Business Plan
for an Art and Souvenir Shop? A few of you have a different opinion about publication. But one aim that will
book can give many info for us. It is absolutely appropriate. Right now, try to closer along with your book.
Knowledge or data that you take for that, it is possible to give for each other; it is possible to share all of
these. Book Business Plan for an Art and Souvenir Shop has simple shape nevertheless, you know: it has
great and massive function for you. You can look the enormous world by open and read a reserve. So it is
very wonderful.

Peter Holmes:

Book is to be different for every grade. Book for children till adult are different content. As we know that
book is very important normally. The book Business Plan for an Art and Souvenir Shop has been making
you to know about other knowledge and of course you can take more information. It doesn't matter what
advantages for you. The guide Business Plan for an Art and Souvenir Shop is not only giving you a lot more
new information but also for being your friend when you really feel bored. You can spend your own personal
spend time to read your guide. Try to make relationship with the book Business Plan for an Art and Souvenir
Shop. You never feel lose out for everything if you read some books.

Clarence Ross:

A lot of people always spent their particular free time to vacation or even go to the outside with them family
or their friend. Were you aware? Many a lot of people spent that they free time just watching TV, or maybe
playing video games all day long. If you want to try to find a new activity here is look different you can read
any book. It is really fun to suit your needs. If you enjoy the book that you read you can spent all day every
day to reading a guide. The book Business Plan for an Art and Souvenir Shop it is rather good to read. There
are a lot of those who recommended this book. We were holding enjoying reading this book. In case you did
not have enough space to bring this book you can buy often the e-book. You can m0ore quickly to read this
book from a smart phone. The price is not very costly but this book possesses high quality.
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