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A thrilling tale of encounters with nature’s masters of biochemistry

In Venomous, the molecular biologist Christie Wilcox investigates venoms and the animals that use them,
revealing how they work, what they do to the human body, and how they can revolutionize biochemistry and
medicine today.
Wilcox takes us from the coast of Indonesia to the rainforests of Peru in search of the secrets of these
mysterious animals. We encounter jellyfish that release microscopic venom-packed darts known to kill
humans in just two minutes, a two-inch caterpillar with toxic bristles that trigger hemorrhaging throughout
the body, and a stunning blue-ringed octopus with saliva capable of inducing total paralysis. How could an
animal as simple as a jellyfish evolve such an intricate, deadly poison? And how can a snake possess
enzymes that tear through tissue yet leave its own body unscathed? Wilcox meets the fearless scientists who
often risk their lives studying these lethal beasts to find out, and puts her own life on the line to examine
these species up close. Drawing on her own research on venom chemistry and evolution, she also shows how
venom is helping us untangle the complex mechanisms of some of our most devastating diseases.
Venomous reveals that the animals we fear the most actually hold the keys to a deeper understanding of
evolution, adaptation, and immunity. Thrilling and surprising at every turn, Venomous will change the way
you think about our natural world.
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From reader reviews:

Frances Carlton:

Your reading 6th sense will not betray an individual, why because this Venomous: How Earth's Deadliest
Creatures Mastered Biochemistry book written by well-known writer whose to say well how to make book
which might be understand by anyone who else read the book. Written inside good manner for you, still
dripping wet every ideas and composing skill only for eliminate your own personal hunger then you still
uncertainty Venomous: How Earth's Deadliest Creatures Mastered Biochemistry as good book not only by
the cover but also with the content. This is one e-book that can break don't evaluate book by its deal with, so
do you still needing a different sixth sense to pick this specific!? Oh come on your reading sixth sense
already alerted you so why you have to listening to another sixth sense.

Sharon Grace:

Are you kind of occupied person, only have 10 as well as 15 minute in your day time to upgrading your mind
ability or thinking skill actually analytical thinking? Then you have problem with the book than can satisfy
your short time to read it because all this time you only find book that need more time to be go through.
Venomous: How Earth's Deadliest Creatures Mastered Biochemistry can be your answer because it can be
read by an individual who have those short extra time problems.

Victoria Austin:

You are able to spend your free time to see this book this book. This Venomous: How Earth's Deadliest
Creatures Mastered Biochemistry is simple to develop you can read it in the playground, in the beach, train
along with soon. If you did not possess much space to bring the actual printed book, you can buy often the e-
book. It is make you simpler to read it. You can save often the book in your smart phone. Consequently there
are a lot of benefits that you will get when you buy this book.

Gerard Norman:

A lot of book has printed but it differs from the others. You can get it by world wide web on social media.
You can choose the best book for you, science, witty, novel, or whatever through searching from it. It is
called of book Venomous: How Earth's Deadliest Creatures Mastered Biochemistry. You can add your
knowledge by it. Without leaving the printed book, it may add your knowledge and make you happier to
read. It is most critical that, you must aware about e-book. It can bring you from one place to other place.
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