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Treasure Hunt

Two surprises await high-stakes repo man Jake Jacobson on his latest job. First, old flame Kelsey Chambers.
Second, gunfire! Seizing the luxury yacht should have been easy, but he hadn't planned on Kelsey's
appearance. Or that smugglers would hijack the vessel to find an antique map hidden on board. The map is
Jake and Kelsey's only leverage…but it carries a price. Without it, they're as good as dead. With it, they're
the target of a relentless hunt. Their failed relationship has Kelsey afraid to rely on Jake again. Can she count
on him with their lives on the line?
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From reader reviews:

Mark Wolf:

Spent a free time for you to be fun activity to accomplish! A lot of people spent their leisure time with their
family, or their friends. Usually they undertaking activity like watching television, planning to beach, or
picnic from the park. They actually doing same every week. Do you feel it? Do you need to something
different to fill your free time/ holiday? Could possibly be reading a book might be option to fill your free
time/ holiday. The first thing that you will ask may be what kinds of e-book that you should read. If you want
to try look for book, may be the e-book untitled Riptide (Love Inspired Suspense) can be very good book to
read. May be it may be best activity to you.

Scott Croft:

You are able to spend your free time you just read this book this e-book. This Riptide (Love Inspired
Suspense) is simple to bring you can read it in the playground, in the beach, train and soon. If you did not
include much space to bring the particular printed book, you can buy typically the e-book. It is make you
much easier to read it. You can save the actual book in your smart phone. So there are a lot of benefits that
you will get when you buy this book.

Wendy Cort:

Do you like reading a e-book? Confuse to looking for your favorite book? Or your book seemed to be rare?
Why so many problem for the book? But just about any people feel that they enjoy regarding reading. Some
people likes studying, not only science book but novel and Riptide (Love Inspired Suspense) or perhaps
others sources were given information for you. After you know how the great a book, you feel need to read
more and more. Science e-book was created for teacher as well as students especially. Those books are
helping them to bring their knowledge. In some other case, beside science publication, any other book likes
Riptide (Love Inspired Suspense) to make your spare time considerably more colorful. Many types of book
like this one.

Maria Swensen:

E-book is one of source of expertise. We can add our know-how from it. Not only for students but
additionally native or citizen have to have book to know the change information of year for you to year. As
we know those publications have many advantages. Beside we add our knowledge, may also bring us to
around the world. With the book Riptide (Love Inspired Suspense) we can consider more advantage. Don't
someone to be creative people? Being creative person must choose to read a book. Only choose the best book
that suited with your aim. Don't always be doubt to change your life at this time book Riptide (Love Inspired
Suspense). You can more pleasing than now.
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