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On January 12, 2010, novelist Dany Laferrière had just ordered dinner at a Port-au-Prince restaurant with a
friend when the earthquake struck. He survived; some three hundred thousand others did not. The quake
caused widespread destruction and left over one million homeless.

This moving and revelatory book is an eyewitness account of the quake and its aftermath. In a series of
vignettes, Laferrière reveals the shock, rage, and grief experienced by those around him, the acts of heroism
he witnessed, and his own sense of survivor guilt. At one point, his nephew, astonished at still being alive,
asks his uncle not to write about "this," "this" being too horrible to give up so easily to those who were not
there. But as a writer, Laferrière can't make such a promise. Still, the question is raised: to whom does this
disaster belong? Who gets to talk and write about it? In this way, this book is not only the chronicle of a
natural disaster; it is also a personal meditation about the responsibility and power of the written word in a
manner that echoes certain post-Holocaust books.

Includes a foreword by Michaëlle Jean, UN special envoy to Haiti and the former Governor General of
Canada.

Dany Laferrière was born in Port-au-Prince, Haiti, in 1953. He is the author of fourteen novels, including
Heading South and How to Make Love to a Negro without Getting Tired. His awards include the Prix
Médicis and the Governor General's Literary Award. He lives in Montreal, Quebec.
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From reader reviews:

Charles Malone:

The book The World is Moving Around Me: A Memoir of the Haiti Earthquake gives you the sense of being
enjoy for your spare time. You can utilize to make your capable far more increase. Book can for being your
best friend when you getting tension or having big problem with the subject. If you can make reading a book
The World is Moving Around Me: A Memoir of the Haiti Earthquake to get your habit, you can get far more
advantages, like add your own personal capable, increase your knowledge about many or all subjects. You
may know everything if you like wide open and read a reserve The World is Moving Around Me: A Memoir
of the Haiti Earthquake. Kinds of book are a lot of. It means that, science guide or encyclopedia or other
people. So , how do you think about this reserve?

John Mallery:

This The World is Moving Around Me: A Memoir of the Haiti Earthquake are generally reliable for you who
want to be described as a successful person, why. The reason of this The World is Moving Around Me: A
Memoir of the Haiti Earthquake can be among the great books you must have is definitely giving you more
than just simple studying food but feed anyone with information that possibly will shock your preceding
knowledge. This book is definitely handy, you can bring it everywhere and whenever your conditions in the
e-book and printed types. Beside that this The World is Moving Around Me: A Memoir of the Haiti
Earthquake giving you an enormous of experience including rich vocabulary, giving you test of critical
thinking that we all know it useful in your day action. So , let's have it appreciate reading.

Michael Hale:

Your reading 6th sense will not betray you actually, why because this The World is Moving Around Me: A
Memoir of the Haiti Earthquake publication written by well-known writer whose to say well how to make
book which can be understand by anyone who else read the book. Written in good manner for you, leaking
every ideas and creating skill only for eliminate your own hunger then you still question The World is
Moving Around Me: A Memoir of the Haiti Earthquake as good book but not only by the cover but also by
the content. This is one e-book that can break don't ascertain book by its handle, so do you still needing
another sixth sense to pick this!? Oh come on your reading through sixth sense already alerted you so why
you have to listening to another sixth sense.

Albert Shepherd:

The book untitled The World is Moving Around Me: A Memoir of the Haiti Earthquake contain a lot of
information on this. The writer explains your ex idea with easy technique. The language is very clear to see
all the people, so do definitely not worry, you can easy to read the item. The book was compiled by famous
author. The author brings you in the new period of time of literary works. You can actually read this book
because you can read on your smart phone, or device, so you can read the book in anywhere and anytime. If



you want to buy the e-book, you can start their official web-site as well as order it. Have a nice go through.
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