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Viewed from above, Greenland offers an endless vista of whiteness interrupted only by scattered ponds of
azure-colored melt water. Ninety percent of Greenland is covered by ice; its ice sheet, the largest outside
Antarctica, stretches almost 1,000 miles from north to south and 600 miles from east to west. But this stark
view of ice and snow is changing -- and changing rapidly. Greenland's ice sheet is melting; the dazzling,
photogenic display of icebergs breaking off Greenland's rapidly melting glaciers has become a tourist
attraction. The Fate of Greenland documents Greenland's warming with dramatic color photographs and
investigates episodes in Greenland's climate history for clues about what happens when climate change is
abrupt rather than gradual.Greenland's climate past and present could presage our climate future. Abrupt
climate change would be cataclysmic: the melting of Greenland's ice shelf would cause sea levels to rise
twenty-four feet worldwide; lower Manhattan would be underwater and Florida's coastline would recede to
Orlando. The planet appears to be in a period of acute climate instability, exacerbated by carbon dioxide we
pour into the atmosphere. As this book makes clear, it is in all of our interests to pay attention to Greenland.
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From reader reviews:

Howard Depriest:

Typically the book The Fate of Greenland: Lessons from Abrupt Climate Change (MIT Press) has a lot
details on it. So when you make sure to read this book you can get a lot of help. The book was compiled by
the very famous author. This articles author makes some research before write this book. This kind of book
very easy to read you can find the point easily after scanning this book.

Bobby Blade:

People live in this new time of lifestyle always try and and must have the time or they will get large amount
of stress from both day to day life and work. So , when we ask do people have spare time, we will say
absolutely of course. People is human not really a robot. Then we ask again, what kind of activity do you
possess when the spare time coming to an individual of course your answer will certainly unlimited right.
Then do you ever try this one, reading textbooks. It can be your alternative with spending your spare time,
the book you have read is actually The Fate of Greenland: Lessons from Abrupt Climate Change (MIT
Press).

Michael Banks:

As we know that book is significant thing to add our know-how for everything. By a publication we can
know everything we want. A book is a group of written, printed, illustrated or maybe blank sheet. Every year
seemed to be exactly added. This book The Fate of Greenland: Lessons from Abrupt Climate Change (MIT
Press) was filled regarding science. Spend your time to add your knowledge about your technology
competence. Some people has several feel when they reading the book. If you know how big good thing
about a book, you can feel enjoy to read a reserve. In the modern era like now, many ways to get book that
you just wanted.

Patrica Fussell:

As a college student exactly feel bored for you to reading. If their teacher questioned them to go to the
library or to make summary for some publication, they are complained. Just minor students that has reading's
soul or real their hobby. They just do what the teacher want, like asked to go to the library. They go to there
but nothing reading seriously. Any students feel that reading is not important, boring and also can't see
colorful pics on there. Yeah, it is to get complicated. Book is very important for you personally. As we know
that on this time, many ways to get whatever we wish. Likewise word says, ways to reach Chinese's country.
So , this The Fate of Greenland: Lessons from Abrupt Climate Change (MIT Press) can make you really feel
more interested to read.
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