
A Visual Defense: The Case for and Against
Christianity

Robert Velarde

Click here if your download doesn"t start automatically

http://sapek.club/go/read.php?id=0825439264
http://sapek.club/go/read.php?id=0825439264
http://sapek.club/go/read.php?id=0825439264


A Visual Defense: The Case for and Against Christianity

Robert Velarde

A Visual Defense: The Case for and Against Christianity Robert Velarde

A logical argument contains premises, objections, conclusions, and rebuttals. Yet when it comes to
arguments defending the Bible and faith—the field of Christian apologetics—too often people defer to
assumptions rather than logical analysis. It may be that they don’t fully understand what they believe or that
they have never been shown how to explain their beliefs.

In order to provide Christians with a means for analyzing arguments so they can understand and defend their
faith, Robert Velarde has developed an accessible means for visually mapping Apologetics. In A Visual
Defense, he shows that visual representations of arguments are not only useful critical thinking tools, but also
can help Christians understand how arguments flow After a discussion of why Apologetics is necessary and
how argument diagrams can help, Velarde gives readers specific arguments for and against God and
Christianity so they can put their mapping skills into practice.

Faith and reason are related. When armed with a solid analytical strategy and biblical knowledge, Christians
can be equipped to tackle any challenge of faith. Christians can both make a robust, positive case for truth
and demonstrate that the Christian faith can withstand the most difficult intellectual attacks.
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From reader reviews:

Eunice Bourque:

As people who live in the actual modest era should be upgrade about what going on or data even knowledge
to make these keep up with the era that is certainly always change and make progress. Some of you maybe
will certainly update themselves by reading books. It is a good choice for yourself but the problems coming
to you actually is you don't know which you should start with. This A Visual Defense: The Case for and
Against Christianity is our recommendation to help you keep up with the world. Why, since this book serves
what you want and need in this era.

David Creason:

Do you one of the book lovers? If yes, do you ever feeling doubt when you are in the book store? Try and
pick one book that you find out the inside because don't ascertain book by its include may doesn't work at
this point is difficult job because you are scared that the inside maybe not since fantastic as in the outside
appear likes. Maybe you answer may be A Visual Defense: The Case for and Against Christianity why
because the great cover that make you consider concerning the content will not disappoint an individual. The
inside or content is usually fantastic as the outside or perhaps cover. Your reading 6th sense will directly
show you to pick up this book.

Louise Fulghum:

Beside this particular A Visual Defense: The Case for and Against Christianity in your phone, it may give
you a way to get nearer to the new knowledge or info. The information and the knowledge you are going to
got here is fresh from the oven so don't become worry if you feel like an older people live in narrow town. It
is good thing to have A Visual Defense: The Case for and Against Christianity because this book offers to
you readable information. Do you at times have book but you don't get what it's exactly about. Oh come on,
that wil happen if you have this in your hand. The Enjoyable option here cannot be questionable, just like
treasuring beautiful island. So do you still want to miss it? Find this book and also read it from now!

Marianne Button:

That book can make you to feel relax. This kind of book A Visual Defense: The Case for and Against
Christianity was colorful and of course has pictures around. As we know that book A Visual Defense: The
Case for and Against Christianity has many kinds or category. Start from kids until teens. For example
Naruto or Detective Conan you can read and think that you are the character on there. Therefore not at all of
book are generally make you bored, any it offers you feel happy, fun and relax. Try to choose the best book
in your case and try to like reading that.
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