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The border states of India, especially in the Northeast, are now considered crucial to the conduct of Indias
foreign policy in the region. There is an urgent need for a robust national doctrine that could guide them in
tackling pressing issues concerning them and also helping them boost their economy by accessing
opportunities beyond borders. Much as it is important to check cross-border infiltration of illegal migrants
and terrorists, a defensive security mindset may prevent states from leveraging the neighbourhood for
economic opportunities.

This volume constructs such a framework by exemplifying Tripuras not-so-well-known influence on Indias
policy towards East Pakistan and then Bangladesh for more than half a centurythe so-called Agartala
doctrine. The contributions to this volume detail the regional environment in Indias eastern and northeastern
neighbourhood, where its Look East policy is unfolding. The collection provides definite pointers to
challenges and opportunities that can be explored for Indias economic growth, strategic advantage, and
cultural influence in a comparative view of similar experiences from China, Russia, and USA.

Bringing together a rich mix of perspectives from academics and practitioners from South Asia, this book is
a valuable window for all those interested in understanding Indias foreign policy in this region.
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From reader reviews:

Eric Ray:

As people who live in the modest era should be up-date about what going on or facts even knowledge to
make them keep up with the era which is always change and advance. Some of you maybe can update
themselves by examining books. It is a good choice for yourself but the problems coming to you actually is
you don't know what one you should start with. This The Agartala Doctrine: A Proactive Northeast in Indian
Foreign Policy is our recommendation to cause you to keep up with the world. Why, as this book serves what
you want and need in this era.

Nellie Nelson:

A lot of people always spent their very own free time to vacation or perhaps go to the outside with them
friends and family or their friend. Do you know? Many a lot of people spent many people free time just
watching TV, or maybe playing video games all day long. If you need to try to find a new activity here is
look different you can read a new book. It is really fun for you personally. If you enjoy the book which you
read you can spent 24 hours a day to reading a e-book. The book The Agartala Doctrine: A Proactive
Northeast in Indian Foreign Policy it is quite good to read. There are a lot of people who recommended this
book. They were enjoying reading this book. When you did not have enough space to bring this book you
can buy the particular e-book. You can m0ore easily to read this book from the smart phone. The price is not
too costly but this book provides high quality.

Nancy Collins:

The reason why? Because this The Agartala Doctrine: A Proactive Northeast in Indian Foreign Policy is an
unordinary book that the inside of the guide waiting for you to snap this but latter it will distress you with the
secret the idea inside. Reading this book adjacent to it was fantastic author who all write the book in such
wonderful way makes the content inside easier to understand, entertaining technique but still convey the
meaning totally. So , it is good for you because of not hesitating having this any longer or you going to regret
it. This amazing book will give you a lot of positive aspects than the other book have such as help improving
your skill and your critical thinking technique. So , still want to delay having that book? If I were you I will
go to the book store hurriedly.

Angela Latham:

Are you kind of stressful person, only have 10 or even 15 minute in your morning to upgrading your mind
expertise or thinking skill perhaps analytical thinking? Then you have problem with the book than can satisfy
your short period of time to read it because this time you only find e-book that need more time to be study.
The Agartala Doctrine: A Proactive Northeast in Indian Foreign Policy can be your answer given it can be
read by an individual who have those short spare time problems.
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