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In this thoroughly revised edition of Managing Growth in America's Communities, readers will learn the
principles that guide intelligent planning for communities of any size, grasp the major issues in successfully
managing growth, and discover what has actually worked in practice (and where and why). This clearly
written book details how American communities have grappled with the challenges of planning for growth
and the ways in which they are adapting new ideas about urban design, green building, and conservation.
Itdescribes the policies and programs they have implemented, and includes examples from towns and cities
throughout the U.S.

 

“Growth management” is essential today, as communities seek to control the location, impact, character and
timing of development in order to balance environmental and economic needs and concerns. Managing
Growth in America's Communities addresses all of the key considerations:

Establishing public roles in community development;●

Determining locations and character of future development;●

Protecting environmental and natural resources;●

Managing infrastructure development;●

Preserving community character and quality;●

Achieving economic and social goals;●

Respecting property rights concerns.●

 

The author, who is one of the nation’s leading authorities on managing community growth, provides
examples from dozens of communities across the country, as well as state and regional approaches. Brief
profiles present overviews of specific problems addressed, techniques utilized, results achieved, and contact
information for further research. Informative sidebars offer additional perspectives from experts in growth
management, including Robert Lang, Arthur C. Nelson, Erik Meyers, and others.

 

This new edition has been completely updated by the author. In particular, he considers issues of population
growth, eminent domain, and the importance of design, especially “green” design. He also reports on the
latest ideas in sustainable development, “smart growth,” neighborhood design, transit-oriented development,
and green infrastructure planning. Like its predecessor, the second edition of Managing Growth in America's
Communities is essential reading for anyone who is interested in how communities can grow intelligently.
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From reader reviews:

Harold Dalton:

Book is definitely written, printed, or descriptive for everything. You can understand everything you want by
a guide. Book has a different type. We all know that that book is important issue to bring us around the
world. Next to that you can your reading ability was fluently. A publication Managing Growth in America's
Communities: Second Edition will make you to possibly be smarter. You can feel a lot more confidence if
you can know about every thing. But some of you think this open or reading a new book make you bored. It
is far from make you fun. Why they may be thought like that? Have you in search of best book or
appropriate book with you?

Larry Tatro:

Often the book Managing Growth in America's Communities: Second Edition will bring that you the new
experience of reading the book. The author style to spell out the idea is very unique. If you try to find new
book you just read, this book very suitable to you. The book Managing Growth in America's Communities:
Second Edition is much recommended to you you just read. You can also get the e-book in the official web
site, so you can more easily to read the book.

David Blackwood:

People live in this new moment of lifestyle always try to and must have the free time or they will get lot of
stress from both everyday life and work. So , once we ask do people have free time, we will say absolutely of
course. People is human not just a robot. Then we question again, what kind of activity do you have when
the spare time coming to an individual of course your answer can unlimited right. Then ever try this one,
reading publications. It can be your alternative within spending your spare time, the book you have read is
Managing Growth in America's Communities: Second Edition.

Pilar Porter:

Is it a person who having spare time and then spend it whole day simply by watching television programs or
just telling lies on the bed? Do you need something totally new? This Managing Growth in America's
Communities: Second Edition can be the solution, oh how comes? It's a book you know. You are and so out
of date, spending your spare time by reading in this brand-new era is common not a geek activity. So what
these books have than the others?
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