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This monograph provides an in-depth study into the issue of vernacular names in Old English documents.
Specifically, it challenges the generally accepted notion that the sex of an individual is definitively indicated
by the grammatical gender of their name. In the case of di-thematic names, the grammatical gender in
question is that of the second element of the name. Thus di-thematic names have been taken as belonging to
women if their second element is grammatically feminine. However, as there are no surviving Anglo-Saxon
texts which explain the principles of vernacular nomenclature, or any contemporary list of Old English
personal names, it is by no means sure that this assumption is correct.
While modern scholars have generally felt no difficulty in distinguishing male from female names, this book
asks how far the Anglo-Saxons themselves recognised this distinction, and in so doing critically examines
and tests the general principle that grammatical gender is a certain indicator of biological sex. Anyone with
an interest in Old English manuscripts or early medieval history will find this book both thought provoking
and a useful reference tool for better understanding the Anglo-Saxon world.
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From reader reviews:

Deborah Ayers:

Do you have favorite book? If you have, what is your favorite's book? Publication is very important thing for
us to understand everything in the world. Each guide has different aim or maybe goal; it means that
publication has different type. Some people experience enjoy to spend their time to read a book. They are
really reading whatever they acquire because their hobby is usually reading a book. Think about the person
who don't like examining a book? Sometime, person feel need book if they found difficult problem or even
exercise. Well, probably you will need this Women's Names in Old English (Studies in Early Medieval
Britain and Ireland).

Jennifer Bedard:

Reading a publication can be one of a lot of task that everyone in the world adores. Do you like reading book
therefore. There are a lot of reasons why people fantastic. First reading a publication will give you a lot of
new details. When you read a guide you will get new information due to the fact book is one of several ways
to share the information or perhaps their idea. Second, looking at a book will make you actually more
imaginative. When you examining a book especially fictional works book the author will bring you to
imagine the story how the figures do it anything. Third, you can share your knowledge to other folks. When
you read this Women's Names in Old English (Studies in Early Medieval Britain and Ireland), you could tells
your family, friends as well as soon about yours book. Your knowledge can inspire others, make them
reading a reserve.

Amy Christensen:

Beside this Women's Names in Old English (Studies in Early Medieval Britain and Ireland) in your phone, it
could possibly give you a way to get nearer to the new knowledge or details. The information and the
knowledge you will got here is fresh through the oven so don't always be worry if you feel like an older
people live in narrow town. It is good thing to have Women's Names in Old English (Studies in Early
Medieval Britain and Ireland) because this book offers to you readable information. Do you oftentimes have
book but you seldom get what it's facts concerning. Oh come on, that won't happen if you have this in your
hand. The Enjoyable set up here cannot be questionable, like treasuring beautiful island. Techniques you still
want to miss the item? Find this book as well as read it from today!

Roland Collins:

Do you like reading a guide? Confuse to looking for your chosen book? Or your book seemed to be rare?
Why so many question for the book? But virtually any people feel that they enjoy for reading. Some people
likes examining, not only science book but also novel and Women's Names in Old English (Studies in Early
Medieval Britain and Ireland) or maybe others sources were given know-how for you. After you know how
the truly amazing a book, you feel wish to read more and more. Science book was created for teacher or



maybe students especially. Those guides are helping them to put their knowledge. In some other case, beside
science reserve, any other book likes Women's Names in Old English (Studies in Early Medieval Britain and
Ireland) to make your spare time much more colorful. Many types of book like this one.
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