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Japan is often regarded as a 'culture of translation'. Oral and written translation has played a vital role in
Japan over the centuries and led to a formidable body of thinking and research. This is rooted in a context
about which little information has been available outside of Japan in the past.

The chapters examine the current state of translation studies as an academic discipline in Japan and a range
of historical aspects (for example, translation of Chinese vernacular novels in early modern times, the role of
translation in Japan's modernization, changes in stylistic norms in Meiji-period translations, 'thick translation'
of indigenous Ainu place names), as well as creative aspects of translation in modern and postwar Japan.
Other chapters explore contemporary phenomena such as the intralingual translation of Japanese expressions
embedded in English texts emanating from diasporic contexts, the practice of pre-translation or writing for
an international audience from the outset, the innovative practice of reverse localization of Japanese video
games back into Japanese, and community interpreting practices and research.
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From reader reviews:

Dora Campfield:

Now a day folks who Living in the era exactly where everything reachable by match the internet and the
resources in it can be true or not require people to be aware of each facts they get. How individuals to be
smart in having any information nowadays? Of course the solution is reading a book. Examining a book can
help persons out of this uncertainty Information particularly this Translation and Translation Studies in the
Japanese Context (Continuum Advances in Translation) book because book offers you rich info and
knowledge. Of course the knowledge in this book hundred % guarantees there is no doubt in it as you know.

Celia Norton:

This book untitled Translation and Translation Studies in the Japanese Context (Continuum Advances in
Translation) to be one of several books that best seller in this year, that's because when you read this book
you can get a lot of benefit onto it. You will easily to buy this kind of book in the book retail outlet or you
can order it via online. The publisher of this book sells the e-book too. It makes you more easily to read this
book, as you can read this book in your Mobile phone. So there is no reason to you personally to past this
book from your list.

Dana Martin:

A lot of people always spent their own free time to vacation or perhaps go to the outside with them
household or their friend. Were you aware? Many a lot of people spent they free time just watching TV, or
even playing video games all day long. If you would like try to find a new activity here is look different you
can read any book. It is really fun for yourself. If you enjoy the book that you read you can spent all day long
to reading a guide. The book Translation and Translation Studies in the Japanese Context (Continuum
Advances in Translation) it is extremely good to read. There are a lot of people who recommended this book.
They were enjoying reading this book. Should you did not have enough space to bring this book you can buy
the e-book. You can m0ore very easily to read this book through your smart phone. The price is not to fund
but this book features high quality.

Roberta Haile:

Playing with family in the park, coming to see the coastal world or hanging out with buddies is thing that
usually you might have done when you have spare time, and then why you don't try point that really opposite
from that. Just one activity that make you not experiencing tired but still relaxing, trilling like on roller
coaster you have been ride on and with addition of information. Even you love Translation and Translation
Studies in the Japanese Context (Continuum Advances in Translation), you may enjoy both. It is excellent
combination right, you still desire to miss it? What kind of hang-out type is it? Oh come on its mind hangout
people. What? Still don't have it, oh come on its named reading friends.
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