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“Push the pause button on whatever it is your group is doing now and follow this guide—study it, discuss it,
digest it, and apply it to your everyday life.”—Bill Hybels

A small group discussion guide for equipping Christians to effectively reach seekers by building
relationships, sharing a verbal witness, and extending invitations to outreach events

This discussion guide for small groups is based on the first three steps of Willow Creek’s seven-step strategy
for turning irreligious people into fully devoted followers of Christ. Each session begins with a compelling
story that sets the stage for group discussion and sparks ideas for putting into practice each of the three
habits. Discussion questions walk participants through the emotional, motivational, and intellectual facets of
each step and provide an opportunity to wrestle with the challenges and discoveries they make individually
and as a group.

The “Charting Your Journey” section helps participants go beyond discussion and move toward personal
application. It provides an opportunity, before God and one another, to commit to specific actions that could
make all the difference in the lives of seeking friends and family members.
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From reader reviews:

Cory Kyle:

Hey guys, do you really wants to finds a new book to learn? May be the book with the concept The Three
Habits of Highly Contagious Christians: A Discussion Guide for Small Groups suitable to you? The actual
book was written by well-known writer in this era. The actual book untitled The Three Habits of Highly
Contagious Christians: A Discussion Guide for Small Groupsis a single of several books which everyone
read now. That book was inspired lots of people in the world. When you read this guide you will enter the
new age that you ever know before. The author explained their concept in the simple way, and so all of
people can easily to be aware of the core of this book. This book will give you a wide range of information
about this world now. So you can see the represented of the world on this book.

Dwight Ambrose:

Your reading sixth sense will not betray a person, why because this The Three Habits of Highly Contagious
Christians: A Discussion Guide for Small Groups book written by well-known writer who knows well how
to make book which can be understand by anyone who else read the book. Written throughout good manner
for you, leaking every ideas and creating skill only for eliminate your current hunger then you still hesitation
The Three Habits of Highly Contagious Christians: A Discussion Guide for Small Groups as good book not
just by the cover but also with the content. This is one publication that can break don't assess book by its deal
with, so do you still needing a different sixth sense to pick this!? Oh come on your examining sixth sense
already alerted you so why you have to listening to one more sixth sense.

Howard Joyce:

In this period globalization it is important to someone to acquire information. The information will make you
to definitely understand the condition of the world. The fitness of the world makes the information easier to
share. You can find a lot of personal references to get information example: internet, magazine, book, and
soon. You will see that now, a lot of publisher that print many kinds of book. Often the book that
recommended to you personally is The Three Habits of Highly Contagious Christians: A Discussion Guide
for Small Groups this book consist a lot of the information from the condition of this world now. This kind
of book was represented so why is the world has grown up. The language styles that writer require to explain
it is easy to understand. The writer made some analysis when he makes this book. Honestly, that is why this
book acceptable all of you.

Griselda Gonzalez:

With this era which is the greater individual or who has ability in doing something more are more important
than other. Do you want to become among it? It is just simple strategy to have that. What you should do is
just spending your time not much but quite enough to get a look at some books. One of many books in the
top record in your reading list is actually The Three Habits of Highly Contagious Christians: A Discussion



Guide for Small Groups. This book that is qualified as The Hungry Hillsides can get you closer in getting
precious person. By looking upward and review this reserve you can get many advantages.
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