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Think of the Highlands as the “backyard” and “backstop” of the Philadelphia–New York–Hartford
metroplex. A backyard that spans over three million acres across Pennsylvania, New York, and Connecticut,
the Highlands serves as recreational open space for the metroplex’s burgeoning human population. As
backstop, Highlands’ watersheds provide a ready source of high-quality drinking water for over fifteen
million people.

The Highlands is the first book to examine the natural and cultural landscape of this four-state region,
showing how it’s distinctive and why its conservation is vital. Each chapter is written by a different leading
researcher and specialist in that field, and introduces readers to another aspect of the Highlands: its
geological foundations, its aquifers and watersheds, its forest ecology, its past iron industry.

In the 1800s, the Highlands were mined, cutover, and then largely abandoned. Given time, the forests
regenerated, the land healed, and the waters cleared. Increasingly, however, the Highlands are under assault
again—polluted runoff contaminating lakes and streams, invasive species choking out the local flora and
fauna, exurban sprawl blighting the rural landscape, and climate change threatening the integrity of its
ecosystems.

The Highlands makes a compelling case for land use planning and resource management strategies that could
help ensure a sustainable future for the region, strategies that could in turn be applied to other landscapes
threatened by urbanization across the country. The Highlands are a valuable resource. And now, so is The
Highlands.
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From reader reviews:

Evelyn White:

This The Highlands: Critical Resources, Treasured Landscapes (Rivergate Books (Hardcover)) are usually
reliable for you who want to be described as a successful person, why. The key reason why of this The
Highlands: Critical Resources, Treasured Landscapes (Rivergate Books (Hardcover)) can be one of the great
books you must have will be giving you more than just simple studying food but feed anyone with
information that perhaps will shock your prior knowledge. This book is usually handy, you can bring it
almost everywhere and whenever your conditions both in e-book and printed ones. Beside that this The
Highlands: Critical Resources, Treasured Landscapes (Rivergate Books (Hardcover)) giving you an
enormous of experience including rich vocabulary, giving you demo of critical thinking that we know it
useful in your day exercise. So , let's have it and enjoy reading.

Matthew Ramey:

The publication untitled The Highlands: Critical Resources, Treasured Landscapes (Rivergate Books
(Hardcover)) is the guide that recommended to you you just read. You can see the quality of the publication
content that will be shown to anyone. The language that creator use to explained their way of doing
something is easily to understand. The article author was did a lot of investigation when write the book,
therefore the information that they share to you personally is absolutely accurate. You also can get the e-
book of The Highlands: Critical Resources, Treasured Landscapes (Rivergate Books (Hardcover)) from the
publisher to make you much more enjoy free time.

Dennis Simpson:

You can get this The Highlands: Critical Resources, Treasured Landscapes (Rivergate Books (Hardcover))
by browse the bookstore or Mall. Simply viewing or reviewing it could possibly to be your solve difficulty if
you get difficulties for the knowledge. Kinds of this e-book are various. Not only by simply written or
printed but also can you enjoy this book simply by e-book. In the modern era including now, you just
looking by your local mobile phone and searching what your problem. Right now, choose your current ways
to get more information about your publication. It is most important to arrange you to ultimately make your
knowledge are still upgrade. Let's try to choose right ways for you.

Linda Amato:

What is your hobby? Have you heard that will question when you got college students? We believe that that
question was given by teacher to their students. Many kinds of hobby, Every person has different hobby. So
you know that little person like reading or as looking at become their hobby. You need to understand that
reading is very important and book as to be the point. Book is important thing to include you knowledge,
except your teacher or lecturer. You will find good news or update regarding something by book. Amount
types of books that can you take to be your object. One of them is this The Highlands: Critical Resources,
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