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When homicide detective Dexter J. Daley's testimony helps send his partner away for murder, the
consequences - and the media frenzy - aren't far behind. He soon finds himself sans boyfriend, sans friends,
and, after an unpleasant encounter in a parking garage after the trial, he's lucky he doesn't find himself sans
teeth. Dex fears he'll get transferred from the Human Police Force's Sixth Precinct, or worse, get dismissed.
Instead, his adoptive father - a sergeant at the Therian-Human Intelligence Recon Defense Squadron
otherwise known as the THIRDS - pulls a few strings, and Dex gets recruited as a Defense Agent.

Dex is determined to get his life back on track and eager to get started in his new job. But his first meeting
with Team Leader Sloane Brodie, who also happens to be his new jaguar Therian partner, turns disastrous.
When the team is called to investigate the murders of three HumaniTherian activists, it soon becomes clear
to Dex that getting his partner and the rest of the tightknit team to accept him will be a lot harder than
catching the killer - and every bit as dangerous.
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From reader reviews:

Kimi Frantz:

Reading a publication can be one of a lot of exercise that everyone in the world loves. Do you like reading
book therefore. There are a lot of reasons why people fantastic. First reading a book will give you a lot of
new data. When you read a guide you will get new information due to the fact book is one of numerous ways
to share the information or perhaps their idea. Second, reading a book will make you actually more
imaginative. When you studying a book especially fiction book the author will bring you to definitely
imagine the story how the people do it anything. Third, you can share your knowledge to some others. When
you read this Hell & High Water: THIRDS, Book 1, you may tells your family, friends and soon about yours
guide. Your knowledge can inspire different ones, make them reading a reserve.

Terry Holmes:

Hell & High Water: THIRDS, Book 1 can be one of your beginner books that are good idea. Many of us
recommend that straight away because this publication has good vocabulary that will increase your
knowledge in vocab, easy to understand, bit entertaining however delivering the information. The copy
writer giving his/her effort to get every word into enjoyment arrangement in writing Hell & High Water:
THIRDS, Book 1 although doesn't forget the main level, giving the reader the hottest and based confirm
resource details that maybe you can be one among it. This great information may drawn you into new stage
of crucial contemplating.

James Rodriguez:

You will get this Hell & High Water: THIRDS, Book 1 by check out the bookstore or Mall. Only viewing or
reviewing it may to be your solve trouble if you get difficulties for ones knowledge. Kinds of this reserve are
various. Not only by written or printed but also can you enjoy this book through e-book. In the modern era
just like now, you just looking from your mobile phone and searching what their problem. Right now, choose
your own ways to get more information about your book. It is most important to arrange yourself to make
your knowledge are still change. Let's try to choose correct ways for you.

Joshua Stpierre:

That book can make you to feel relax. This kind of book Hell & High Water: THIRDS, Book 1 was colorful
and of course has pictures on there. As we know that book Hell & High Water: THIRDS, Book 1 has many
kinds or type. Start from kids until youngsters. For example Naruto or Private investigator Conan you can
read and believe that you are the character on there. Therefore not at all of book are generally make you
bored, any it can make you feel happy, fun and relax. Try to choose the best book for you personally and try
to like reading that will.
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